PRODUCT
Floor finish Johnson Complete or
Equivalent 25% OR HIGHER SOLIDS

All Purpose Cleaner - Spitfire

All Purpose Cleaner - Fastball

Floor Finish Stripper for Extreme Buildup
Non-Ammonias ** should easily lift dirt,
soap wax for easy pick-up

Carpet Extraction Cleaner

Dust Mop Treatment

CONTAINER

5 GALLON

320z

320z

5 gallon

Gallon

1 Gallon

HILLYARD
Hillyard Explorer
HILO053407
106.34
5gallon

50.79 /cs 4.23/qt

Fastball (equivalent)

41L0101804

50.79 /cs 4.23/qt

Hillyard Power Strip
HILO015007
47.89 5gal

Hillyard Clean Action Il
HIL0090206 1gal
17.29 gal

Hillyard Super HIl Tone

HIL0021506
1 Gal, 4/cs

29.10 gal 116.41/cs

KENWAY
SSS Turn 4 Floor Finish
5 gal Pail
79.60

73.64/cs

No Bid

SSS Pit Stop Floor
stripper 246025
45.11/cs 2 2.5gal

SSS New Concept
CS 4 Gal 050912
84.60/cs

No Bid

Barret- Fisher

SP-407305 Spartan
111.00 per pail

SP 001904 44.16/CS

WS- FAST 45.36/CS

SP-008205

64.39

SP-300504

52.32/CS

SP-301304 Spartan Dust

Mop
38.36

Henry A Peter

BETC 696B50D
87.98

BETC 1731200
PETTER# 104896
37.74

BETC 17312.00
PETTER #104896
37.74

BETC 888B500
87.90

BETC 40204.00
PETTER# 104990
62.83

BETC 120040
102.86



CONTAINER

Toilet Bowl Cleaner, RTU no more than
11% HCL, pleasant scent, EPA registered.
To clean lime, soap scum, hard water, uric

. Quarts
acid, etc

Non-Acid Bowl Cleaner ** Concentrated
daily maintenance cleaner and deodorizer
for toilet bowls, urinals, bathtubs, sinks,
shower stalls, and other hard non-porous

surfaces. Quarts

Disinfectant Cleaner Concentrate Neutral
germicidal cleaner and deodorizer that
provides both cleaning and disinfection.
Effective against HIV-1, HBV, and HCV,
CA-MRSA and kills Pandemic 2009 H1N1
Influenza A. For use on hard non-porous
surfaces such as floors, walls, metal
surfaces, tables, chairs, countertops,
porcelain and sinks.

or
1 Gallon

Hydrogen Peroxide
Cleaner/Degreaser
**Concentrated formulated with
natural citrus oils and hydrogen
peroxide. Should quickly
penetrates, then oxidizes and
effectively removes a wide range
of soils from carpets and hard

Gallon

HILLYARD KENWAY
Hillyard Liquid Swabby
HIL0O010404
e No Bid
32.70 CS
2.63 QT
Hillyard Arsenal1 Non- Acid SSS Pleascent Clean
Restroom Non-Acid Bowl Cleaner
Disinfectant Cleaner 2.5 lit 4/cs CS12QT
HIL0O081925 Kenway #050607A
2.5L 30.63/cs
Hillyard Arsenal 1 Re-juvnal SSS Navigator PDC Ace
Hil0081625 256 Neutral Disinfectant
2.5 lier 4/CS CS23L
20.13/2.5L makes 812 QT RTU
57.47Ics
Hillyard Aresenal 1 Suprox SSS Hyper Speed
Mulitipurpose Peroxide Cleaner ~ Peroxide All-Purpose
2.5L bottle, 4/CS CS 4 Gal 48126
HIL0083825
29.80/cs )cs

1.0332/ diluted gal

Henry A Peter

Barret- Fisher

23.59
No Bid

27.39
No Bid

10.88
No Bid

63.02
No Bid



surfaces.

Glass & Multi-Surface Cleaner
**Concentrated with a blend of
ingredients that dissolves greasy
film, fingerprints and smears
leaving glass and other hard
surfaces smudge-and streak free.
Versatile product to effectively
clean mirrors, glass, Plexigals,
acrylic, stainless steel, chrome
countertops, tabletops and other
hard surfaces.

Floor Cleaner (Neutral Ph)

** Concentrated Cleaner

that removes soil without the
use of harsh chemicals.
Formulated for use on all types
of finished floors, painted walls,
Formica, vinyl, plastic and metal
surfaces. This extremely
versatile product can be used
in autoscrubbers, mop buckets
and spray bottles.

MEDIUM - Wet Mop Heads (cotton/syn blenc

Blended, Colored Loop End

Must have Tail Bands for wide

even coverage & 5" wide head bands
Medium weight

LARGE - Wet Mop Heads (cotto/syn blend)

CONTAINER HILLYARD
Hillyard Windo Clean+
Aerosol
HIL010255, 190z
51.93/cs 4.33/ea
Aerosol
0z

or equivalent

Hillyard Arsenal 1 Top Clean

2.51irt 4/CS

HIL0O081025

38.53/2.5L
$0.2270/ dilutes gal

Gallon

Mop Wet Blended Looped
End
WB Med NAT
HIL24991
3.76 ea

10 each

Mop Wet Blend Loooped
End WB LG NAT

WA AAAA

KENWAY

Barret- Fisher

179011H Claire Gleme No Bid
HD Glass Cleaner CS 12
190z
)1/cs
SSS 48102 Power Play No Bid
Cleaner CS/4 gal
5 4gal

SSS 37041 Value Plus
Blended 5" Headband

CS 40.32/cs of 12
43.38/cs

4.29 ea

SSS 37042 Value Plus
Blended 5" Headband

~~

an~

ABCO DMTL/ 12524 DBC

Henry A Peter

42.72

31.37

5.50/CS
12 PER CASE

70.55/CS
12 PER CASE



Blended, Colored Loop End

Must have Tail Bands for wide

even coverage & 5" wide head bands
Medium weight

MEDIUM - Wet Mop Heads

Micro Fiber

Must have Tail Bands for wide

even coverage & 5" wide head bands
Medium weight

LARGE - Wet Mop Heads

Micro Fiber

Must have Tail Bands for wide

even coverage & 5" wide head bands

Medium weight

Floor Machine Pads for Polishing (White)

Floor Machine Pads for Polishing (Burnish)
(Beige Pads)

Floor Machine Pads for Stripping (Black)

CONTAINER

10 each

10 each

10 each

Case of 5

Case of 5

Case of 5

HILLYARD
HIL24992

5.08/ea

MOP Tube MF WB
Medium Green
HIL20071
98.45/ea

Mop Tube MF
WB Large Blue HIL20067
9.04 ea

Americo
HIL42020
20" 21.38/CS
case of 5

Americo
HIL42520
20" 21.81/CS

case of 5

Americo
HIL42920
20" 27.94/cs

KENWAY
CS 12 Mops

65.35/cs

SSS 37181 Medium
No Lint Mop Green
CS 12 Mops

117.78/cs

SSS 37189 Large
No Lint Microfiber Mop
Green CS 12 MOPS
139.38/ cs

SSS 31119
20" White Pads
17.28/cs

SSS 31134
20" Tan Buff- Polish
17.28

SSS 31036

20" Black Stripping Pads

17.28

Henry A Peter

Barret- Fisher
ABCO DMTL/ 12548 DBC

9.20
75.11/CS
6 PER CASE
MRLZ-MD-5GR
13.29ea
35.51/ CS
6 PER CASE
CA-3633224 10.62
21.26 CS
23.73
22.33CS
23.73
21.26 CS
23.73



Liquid Carpet Spotter

Plastic Bags
250 per case
30 gallon size
30" x 36"

Plastic Bags
100 per case
55 gallon size
38" x 58"

Plastic Bags
1000 per case or supplied
12 gallon size

Soap Pads
Ex: Brillo

Pistol Grip Spray and Bottle
Complete

Bleach

CONTAINER

320z Spray
Bottle

zS
No less than
1 mill

100 bag/CS
No
less than
1.2 Mill

1000/CS No
less than
1.5 mills

3207

Gallon

HILLYARD

Hillyard Carpet Spotter

HIL0091004 12qt/cs
sold by case
60.60/cs

LR3037100K
20-30 GAl 30X37
1 MIL 250/CS
27.55/cs

1.25 Mill
LRV3860125K
60 gal 38X60 100/cs
23.50

1.25 Mill
LR2432125K

12-16 GAL 24X32 250/CS

25.41

SOS Soap Pad T
CL088320 180/CS
55.23/cs

Bottle + Trigger Set
HIL31950 + HIL26011
1.83/EA

Bleach 1gal/6 CS
Sold by case
24.45/CS of 6 4.08/gal

KENWAY
SSS 48017
All Purpose Spotter
56.55/cs

1 Mil SSS 72958 CS 200
case/250 bags
22.10/cs

1.2 mill SSS 72958 CS
100
Case/100 bags

26.40/cs

Case 1000 bags
SSS72965 CS 1000
17.86/cs

No Bid

1.80 ea

KIK Pure Ultra Bleach
CS 6 gal 230230
26.52/cs

Barret- Fisher

CE-SPOT 7.93

1 mil

JA-303610B

27.20

1.2mil  JA385815B

1.5MIL

24.34

JC 2432

38.27/PK500

No Bid

NO BID

7500 350
4.85 EA

Henry A Peter

12/CS
138.93

26.62
753216

23.50
797802

866933
25.23

RwW240000

7.73/ 10PACK

1.55 EA

ETER# 137327
2.97



Dust Mop Heads only

Dust Mop Frames and

Handles

Lotion Hand Soap (Bulk)

Sealer

Johnson's Technique or

Equivalent

Liquid Concentrate Spray

Deodorant

Disinfectant Spray

CONTAINER HILLYARD KENWAY
HILLYARD/GOLDEN STAR
18" HIL53402 5.14 37248 6.78
24" HIL53404 6.76 37249 8.01
36" HIL53406 9.63 37251 10.98
48" HIL53408 11.74 37253 14.63
18" HIL52813 2.75 37885 2.80
24" HIL52815 3.10 37886 3.10
36" HIL52817 3.78 37887 3.75
48" HIL52819 5.08 37888 5.75
Pink Pearl Hand Soap by SSS 44079 Tender Care
Hillyard or equivalent Pink Lotion Soap 133720
Gallon HIL0039606 39.26/cs
Sold by case
40.75/cs

Hillyard 340 Seal Hil0034007 = SSS 48085 Final Lap
99.95/5GAL Sealer CS 2 2.5 gal

5 gallons 89.80

Hillyard Odor Counteractant SSS Water Soluble
Robusto HIL0O018004 Deoderant
200z 12qt per cs CS 12 Qt 067304

74.85/cs 6.24/qt 70.68/cs

Hillyard Aerosol Super Hil
Aire ).66/cs of 12
Gallon Citrus 160z HIL0105654
59.10/cs
6.23/EA

CPG PINK 5.98

SP-555504 65.35

60213

Barret- Fisher
18" 4.50
24" 5.39

36" NO BID
48" NO BID

18" 3.49
24" 4.07
36" 5.03
48" 6.89

No Bid

49.40/CS

Henry A Peter

'8.76
10.9
'15.15
48"NO BID

18" 3.79
24" 4.28
36" 5.51
48" 8.17

104821
34.20

C-607B500
86.32 EA

NO BID

04798
58.90



Floor Finish Spray Buff to be used
with high speed buffer

Urinal Screens

Premium All Purpose Wipes

Wypalls L40 Jumbo Rolls

Carpet Shampoo Extractor Concentrate

Tile Floor Machine Cleaner

Disinfecting Wipes

CONTAINER

Gallon

Case

Case

HILLYARD

Hillyard Hil-Glo
HIL0053306

Nilodor Deodorant Rubber
Urinal Screen
1.18/ screen

Hillyard Wiper All Purpose
HIL21411 100/bx 4/cs

White 12.5X13.4
KIM05007 750/roll

Hillyard Defoamer I
HILO018306

Hillyard Nutra- Rinse

79.54/ cs 19.89 Gal

Contec Sporicidin Disinfectant

CTICAN18012F 180ct

KENWAY

No Bid

SSS 08048
Urinal Screens
}8/cs of 12

Brawney Industrial

Wypalls

99.79/case 18 56¢t

boxes

73.67/cs

SSS 48010 Foam
Eliminator 050911
66.77/cs 4 gal

SSS 48003 Rinse Plus

050802

63.00/CS 4 gal

Lysol Flat Packs Lemon

22.06/cs 6 80ct

Barret- Fisher

SP-444004 13.00

15.06/CS of 12

KC 03046 85.53

KC 05007 74.00

NO BID

NO BID

SA-P22884 71.64

Henry A Peter

TC 6080400

50.40

$125654

13.26

11973

46.63

#119761

99.22

04991

15.96

52.07

118.56



CONTAINER

Dry Erase Board Cleaner (whiteboard)
Spray

XTRA LARGE - Vinyl Disposable Gloves

LARGE - Vinyl Disposable Gloves

MEDUIM - Vinyl Disposable Gloves

Eraser Sponge

Stainless Steel Cleaner and Polish

19-200z

Floor Cleaner/Polish

(remove soil and leave shine on floor) Al

HILLYARD
HILO109355 19 oz 12/CS
sold by case
37.95/CS

10 box/cs
1L30483
21.20/cs 2.12/bx

HIL30482
21.20/CS 2.12/bx

Ambitex

HIL30481 21.20

Ics 2.12/box

illyard Glacier Hand Pad
IL30312 24/cs
26.68/cs

0103455
less steel cleaner
58.50/cs 4.88ea

Hillyard Top Clean
HIL0014406

KENWAY
Claire CL862 Gleme
Utility Cleaner CS 12-
190z 49.17/case

>S 10bx/ 100 gloves
35.71lcs

S 10bx/ 100 gloves
35.71lcs

>S 10bx/ 100 gloves
35.71/cs

3M 4004CC Scotchbrite
Easy Eraser
18.40cs 12

SSS 21202 Stainless
eaner CS 12 160z
57.79/cs

SSS 48105 Bump N Run
.er/ Maintainer

An an

Barret- Fisher

No Bid

IN-VF004 2.84

IN-VFO03 2.84

IN-VF002 2.84

43.41/36

74.65/ 12

SP-301604 9.75 39/CS

Henry A Peter

42.72

4.1

2.59

2.59

42.72

1104780

63.78

63.51



Cleaner/Degreaser
- all natural ingredients
- no bleach, ammonia, phospahtes, acids

Laundry Detergent

Furniture Polish

Hand Soap (Dispenser 1200-2000 ml)

Hand Sanitizer (dispenser 1200-2000 ml)

Henry A Peter

CONTAINER HILLYARD KENWAY Barret- Fisher
Gailon i by 1gal 4/cs 36.13/cs

29.95/cs 7.49 ea

Hillyard Citrus Scrub SSS Navigator PDC 42.04

HIL0014306 Maverick HO HD

5-1 gallon Sold by 1gal 4/cs Degreaser CS23L  sp.213004 10.44 41.76/CS
107.50/cs 26.88ea Bottles 56.03
Ics
Hillyard laundry Detergent USC Fresh & Clean CS 4 WS-HELAUN 10.29 41.16 66.5
HIL0045906 AL
24.14 GAL 85.98/cs
Hillyard Aerosol Lustre Mist = SSS 21005 Citra CS 12 CL-818 72.20 =TC 06023-00E
Furniture Polish 180z ans 4.49
HIL0103155 56.94
old by the case 12/cs
45.45/cs 3.79/can

HIL0039403 Affinity Foam 46.47cs C 92540-00

Hand Soap 1000ML 4/cs 10.95
55.31/cs SP-4602 Foamy 1Q
Cranberry ICE 42.00 per
cas

HIL0041003 Affinity Foaming 62.86 CS NO BID 3ETC 92541-00
Hand Sanitizer 1000ML 4/cs 1000ML 10.95

75.57/cs



Roll Paper Towels

Bathroom Tissue

CONTAINER

HILLYARD KENWAY Barret- Fisher
PAP10100 Towel Roll GSC
Natural 800/ft/rool 6 rolls/cs
46.98 NPS-7850N
52.75CS 8X1000 44 .90

PAP10170 Tissue Opticore

GSC 2 PLY 865ft/roll 49.24cs 2 PLY
36rolls/cs SSS Sterling select
50.96/cs dispensers installed at no

e NPS-209 57.15

Henry A Peter

\PAS 40800
44.3

\S 19230
40.88



Henry A Peter

CONTAINER HILLYARD KENWAY Barret- Fisher



Henry A Peter

CONTAINER HILLYARD KENWAY Barret- Fisher







































